
Wiha Screwdriver Handles.

Wiha SoftFinish®. The specialist for dry and general applications. 
Comfortable multi-component handle with soft zone for optimum torque 
transfer. Chrome-vanadium-molybdenum steel blade, through-hardened, 
matt chrome-plated.

Wiha SoftFinish® electric. The safe and comfortable insulated VDE 
screwdriver. VDE insulated multi-component handle with soft zone for 
optimum torque transfer. GS tested, for work on or around live 
components up to 1,000 V AC.

Wiha SoftFinish® ESD. The ESD screwdriver. Comfortable multi-
component handle with soft zone, dissipative. Chrome-vanadium-
molybdenum steel blade, through-hardened, matt chrome-plated.

Wiha MicroFinish®. The specialist for wet and oily applications. Non-
slip handle with micro-fine surface structure. Chrome-vanadium-
molybdenum steel blade, through-hardened, matt chrome-plated. 

Wiha Classic. The robust screwdriver for multiple applications. Square 
handle made from impact-resistant plastic that is also resistant to oil and 
chemicals. Chrome-vanadium steel blade, through-hardened.

Wiha Classic electric. The compact classic. VDE insulated square 
handle. GS tested, for work on or around live components up to 1,000 V 
AC.

Wiha Voltage and Automotive Circuit Testers. VDE tested 
voltage testers. Test range up to 250 V AC.

Wiha PicoFinish®. The comfortable precision screwdriver. 
Comfortable multi-component precision handle with soft zone and rotating 
cap. Chrome-vanadium-molybdenum steel blade, through-hardened, matt 
chrome-plated.

Wiha Precision. The classic precision screwdriver. Handle with rotating 
cap.

Wiha Precision ESD. The dissipative ESD precision screwdriver. 
Dissipative handle, ESD safe, with rotating cap.

Wiha Ceramic. The adjustment screwdriver for laboratories and clean 
rooms. Blade made from high-quality zirconium ceramic, 
antistatic/antimagnetic.

Wiha Pocket Screwdrivers. The pocket screwdriver. Handle made of 
transparent plastic.

Wiha Wood. The all-rounder for woodworking applications. Handle 
made of sealed beech wood with leather cap. Through blade with hex 
bolster made of chrome-vanadium steel.


